

Huntley Community School District 158  
Roof Replacement and Restoration Bid # 2018-68

Bid Summary Sheet  
Bid Opening - December 4, 2018 @ 9:30 a.m.

Bidder	Bid Bond	Addendum 1, 2, 3, 4	Certificate of Eligibility to Bid	Certificate of IDHR	Certificate of IL Prevailing Wage	Hold Harmless Agreement	Reference List	Conley & Mackeben Elementary Schools		Administration Transportation Bldg. & Huntley High School Storage Bldg.			
								Base Bid #1	Unit Price	Base Bid #2	Unit Prices		
								Rehabilitation of Flat Roof Areas	Add or Deduct for Labor and Material Rate For Replacement of Additional Wet or Deteriorated Tapered Insulation \$ Sq.ft.	Replacement of Shingled Roof Systems and Attic Ventilation Systems Remediation	Add or Deduct for Labor and Material Rate for Additional Nailing of Existing OSB or Plywood Deck \$ Sq.Ft.	Add or Deduct for Labor and Material Rate for Replacement of Deteriorated OSB Nail Base in Kind \$ Sq.Ft.	Add or Deduct for Labor and Material Rate for Replacement of Deteriorated 5/8" Plywood Deck in Kind \$\$Sq.Ft.
All American Exterior Solutions	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	No Bid	No Bid	\$331,700.00	\$0.35	\$14.00	\$3.50
DCG Roofing Solutions	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$604,100.00	\$11.00	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Knickerbocker Roofing	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$514,900.00	\$3.15	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
L Marshall Roofing	X	<b>1</b>	X	X	X	X	X	<b>\$493,700.00</b>	\$10.00	\$527,800.00	\$0.45	\$10.00	\$4.50
Malcor Roofing of Illinois	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$512,000.00	\$7.50	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid	No Bid
Riddiford Roofing	<b>2</b>	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$505,837.00	\$12.25	\$389,860.00	\$0.32	\$9.50	\$4.25
Sealtant Exteriors Inc.	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$620,000.00	\$8.00	\$519,155.00	\$0.30	\$10.00	\$4.00
Weatherguard Roofing	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	No Bid	No Bid	<b>\$305,500.00</b>	\$0.25	\$9.00	\$3.00

Key to Notes

1 = Only Addendums 1 thru 3 are noted;. i.e. Addendum No. 4 is not noted

2 = Bid Bond is named for Conley and Mackeben Schools only