

**Huntley Community School District 158**  
**Roof Replacement and Restoration Bid # 2017-68 - Leggee School**  
**Bid Opening March 22, 2017 @ 2:30 p.m.**  
**Bid Tally Sheet**

Bidder	Bid Bond	Acknowledgement 1,2,3 and 4	Certificate of Eligibility to Bid	Certificate of IDHR	Certificate of IL. Prevailing Wage	Hold Harmless Agreement	Reference List	Base Bid	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	Unit Price	
								Leggee Elementary	Labor Rate	5/8 " OSB	5/8 " Plywood	3" Flat Stock Insulation	Replacement Tapered Insulation	Installation of Shingle Expansion Per Exp. Jt.	
All American Exterior	x	x	x	x	x	x	x	\$ 1,329,000.00	\$ 0.40	\$ 4.00	\$ 4.25	\$ 4.50	\$ 8.50	\$ 8,400.00	
L Marshall Inc.	x	x	x	x	x	x	x	\$ 1,326,200.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 15.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 25.00	\$ 35.00	\$ 4,400.00	
CPR Roofing	No Bid														
Filotto Roofing	No Bid														
Knickerbocker Roofing	x	x	x	x	x	x	x	\$ 2,190,500.00	\$ 2.00	\$ 4.00	\$ 8.00	\$ 3.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 260.00	
Mc Dermaid Roofing	No Bid														
G. E.Riddiford Roofing	x	x	x	x	x	x	x	\$ 1,530,249.00	\$ 1.50	\$ 14.00	\$ 5.00	\$ 4.50	\$ 5.00	\$ 5,500.00	
Sika Corporation	No Bid														
Tremco	No Bid														
Weatherguard Roofing	No Bid														