

Huntley Community School District 158

HVAC Preventative Maintenance Services Bid # 2017-44

Bids opened at 2:30 p.m. August 22, 2017

Bid Summary

Bidder	Addenda 1 & 2	Bid Bond	Proof of Insurance	Cert of Eligibility	Anti-Collusion Affidavit	Hold Harmless Agreement	Equipment & Materials List	Reference List	Employee Turn Over Rate	Contractor Organize Chrt	Contractor's OperationsChart	Training Program	Workman's Comp Mod Rate	Statement of Qualifications	Customer Contact Procedure	Financial Information	Base Bid	Alternate Bid "A" Remove Bryan boiler burners with Heating A inspection	Alternate Bid "B" Remove Bryan boiler side panels with Heating A inspection	Optional Performance and Payment Bonds	Total Cost of Unit Prices for Service Calls - Labor Rates					Comments			
																					Combination of Base Bid and Alternate Bid B	Straight Time	Overtime	Double Time	Material Cost Mark-Up		Trip Charge		
Hayes Mechanical	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$ 44,000	\$ 20,792	\$ 23,760	\$ 750	\$ 67,760	\$116.00	\$168.00	\$223.00	20%	\$55.00			
Advantage Mechanical	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$ 48,450	\$ 6,600	\$ 2,640	\$ 1,340	\$ 51,090	\$120.00	\$180.00	\$240.00	20%	0			
YMI Mechanical	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$ 38,000	\$ 25,500	\$ 19,900	\$ 430	\$ 57,900	\$110.00	\$140.00	\$160.00	10%	\$60.00			
AMI	No Bid																												
Mechanical Inc	No Bid																												
General Mechanical	X	1	X	X	X	X	X	X	2	2	2	2	2	2	2	2	\$42,975	\$ 8,000	\$ 8,000	\$458/\$128	\$ 50,975	\$125.00	\$180.00	\$225.00	10%	\$35.00	Incomplete bid		
Midwest Mechanical	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	X	\$ 79,860	\$ 27,600	\$ 7,200		\$ 87,060	\$150.00	\$225.00	\$300.00	10%	\$80.00			
Northern Weatherworks	No Bid																												
Emcor Services	No Bid																												

Special Notes

1. Bid bond provided is 5%, and specifications call for a 10% bid bond
2. These items not furnished with contractors bid package. Bid specifications call for these items to be provided as a part of a complete bid.